
Item # Spec. No. Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
1 01530 Airfield Barricades 1                L.S. 30,000.00$      30,000.00$               88,000.00$      88,000.00$                 635,540.00$    635,540.00$               
2 C-100A Contractor Quality Control Plan (CQCP) - Base Bid: Alternate 1 1                L.S. 229,000.00$    229,000.00$             135,000.00$    135,000.00$               135,500.00$    135,500.00$               
3 C-102A Temporary Inlet Protection 2                Each 750.00$           1,500.00$                 800.00$           1,600.00$                   300.00$           600.00$                       
4 C-102B Temporary Silt Fence 16,800      L.F. 6.00$               100,800.00$             3.25$               54,600.00$                 3.25$               54,600.00$                 
5 C-105A Mobilization (10% max.) - Base Bid: Alternate 1 1                L.S. 900,000.00$    900,000.00$             900,000.00$    900,000.00$               995,500.00$    995,500.00$               
6 P-101A Asphalt Pavement Milling 76,530      S.Y. 10.00$             765,300.00$             6.00$               459,180.00$               * 9.50$               727,035.00$               
7 P-101B Pavement Removal by Milling 14,130      S.Y. 15.00$             211,950.00$             7.00$               98,910.00$                 9.50$               134,235.00$               
8 P-101C Remove Abandoned Light Cans 45              Each 500.00$           22,500.00$               480.00$           21,600.00$                 325.00$           14,625.00$                 
9 P-101D Medium Cracks Repair 54,018      L.F. 5.00$               270,090.00$             1.95$               105,335.10$               4.00$               216,072.00$               
10 P-401 FAA Asphalt Surface Course 110            TON 350.00$           38,500.00$               465.00$           51,150.00$                 465.00$           51,150.00$                 
11 P-403 SCDOT Type C Asphalt Surface Course 1,320         TON 150.00$           198,000.00$             260.00$           343,200.00$               260.00$           343,200.00$               
12 P-501A 6-Inch Thick Concrete Pavement 54,200      S.Y. 80.00$             4,336,000.00$          91.50$             4,959,300.00$            75.00$             4,065,000.00$            
13 P-501B 7-Inch Thick Concrete Pavement 12,600      S.Y. 90.00$             1,134,000.00$          92.00$             1,159,200.00$            84.00$             1,058,400.00$            
14 P-603 Emulsified Asphalt Tack Coat 849            GAL 6.00$               5,094.00$                 50.00$             42,450.00$                 * 50.00$             42,450.00$                 
15 P-620A Temporary Pavement Marking, White -            S.F. 2.00$               -$                          -$                 -$                            -$                 -$                            
16 P-620B Permanent Reflective Pavement Marking, White 83,300      S.F. 2.00$               166,600.00$             1.36$               113,288.00$               1.50$               124,950.00$               
17 P-620C Temporary Pavement Marking, Yellow 30              S.F. 1.50$               45.00$                      1.64$               49.20$                         5.00$               150.00$                       
18 P-620D Permanent Reflective Pavement Marking, Yellow 3,392         S.F. 2.00$               6,784.00$                 1.36$               4,613.12$                   * 1.50$               5,088.00$                   
19 P-620E Permanent Non-Reflective Pavement Marking, Black 23,100      S.F. 2.00$               46,200.00$               0.68$               15,708.00$                 1.50$               34,650.00$                 
20 P-620F Obliterate Markings 1,570         S.F. 5.00$               7,850.00$                 2.84$               4,458.80$                   3.00$               4,710.00$                   
21 P-620G Pavement Surface Cleaning 40,040      S.F. 0.30$               12,012.00$               0.40$               16,016.00$                 0.25$               10,010.00$                 
22 P-621 Saw-Cut Grooves 56,020      S.Y. 3.00$               168,060.00$             2.40$               134,448.00$               3.50$               196,070.00$               
23 P-632 Asphalt Pavement Rejuvenation 1,500         S.Y. 7.00$               10,500.00$               5.40$               8,100.00$                   8.00$               12,000.00$                 
24 T-901 Seeding 4                Acre 4,000.00$        16,000.00$               2,100.00$        8,400.00$                   3,500.00$        14,000.00$                 
25 T-905B Offsite Topsoil 1,770         C.Y. 110.00$           194,700.00$             110.00$           194,700.00$               45.00$             79,650.00$                 
26 L-125D Temporary Airfield Lighting - Complete 1                L.S. 210,000.00$    210,000.00$             227,550.00$    227,550.00$               475,775.00$    475,775.00$               

TOTAL BID AMOUNT SCHEDULE A - BASE BID: ALTERNATE 1 (CONCRETE): 9,081,485.00$     -$                    -$                    9,146,856.22$       9,430,960.00$       

LOWCOUNTRY REGIONAL AIRPORT

SEE PAGE 2 FOR SCHEDULE B AND PAGE 3 FOR SCHEDULE C

NO BID NO BID

Webber Construction 
SCHEDULE A - BASE BID: ALTERNATE 1 (CONCRETE)

Engineer's Estimate Quality Enterprises Banks Construction Hi-Way Paving
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LOWCOUNTRY REGIONAL AIRPORT

BID TABULATION
RUNWAY 5-23 REHABILITATION PROJECT

BID NO.: RBW-2025-02

BID OPENING DATE:  Wednesday, April 30th, 2025 at 2:00 PM

Item # Spec. No. Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
1 01530 Airfield Barricades 1                L.S. 30,000.00$      30,000.00$               62,474.00$      62,474.00$               250,000.00$    250,000.00$             
2 C-100B Contractor Quality Control Plan (CQCP) - Base Bid: Alternate 2 1                L.S. 201,000.00$    201,000.00$             345,913.00$    345,913.00$             584,000.00$    584,000.00$             
3 C-102A Temporary Inlet Protection 2                Each 750.00$           1,500.00$                 181.00$           362.00$                    450.00$           900.00$                    
4 C-102B Temporary Silt Fence 16,800      L.F. 6.00$               100,800.00$             4.00$               67,200.00$               3.60$               60,480.00$               
5 C-105B Mobilization (10% max.) - Base Bid: Alternate 2 1                L.S. 800,000.00$    800,000.00$             614,191.00$    614,191.00$             720,000.00$    720,000.00$             
6 P-101A Asphalt Pavement Milling 82,420      S.Y. 8.00$               659,360.00$             6.00$               494,520.00$             5.50$               453,310.00$             
7 P-101B Pavement Removal by Milling 14,130      S.Y. 15.00$             211,950.00$             7.00$               98,910.00$               6.00$               84,780.00$               
8 P-101C Remove Abandoned Light Cans 45              Each 500.00$           22,500.00$               555.00$           24,975.00$               445.00$           20,025.00$               
9 P-101D Medium Cracks Repair 54,018      L.F. 5.00$               270,090.00$             6.00$               324,108.00$             3.30$               178,259.40$             
10 P-401 FAA Asphalt Surface Course 18,510      TON 250.00$           4,627,500.00$          228.00$           4,220,280.00$          230.00$           4,257,300.00$          
11 P-403 SCDOT Type C Asphalt Surface Course 1,320         TON 150.00$           198,000.00$             234.00$           308,880.00$             180.00$           237,600.00$             
12 P-603 Emulsified Asphalt Tack Coat 10,764      GAL 6.00$               64,584.00$               12.00$             129,168.00$             5.00$               53,820.00$               
13 P-620A Temporary Pavement Marking, White 83,300      S.F. 1.00$               83,300.00$               1.00$               83,300.00$               0.60$               49,980.00$               
14 P-620B Permanent Reflective Pavement Marking, White 83,300      S.F. 2.00$               166,600.00$             1.00$               83,300.00$               1.10$               91,630.00$               
15 P-620C Temporary Pavement Marking, Yellow 3,392         S.F. 1.50$               5,088.00$                 3.00$               10,176.00$               1.40$               4,748.80$                 
16 P-620D Permanent Reflective Pavement Marking, Yellow 3,392         S.F. 2.00$               6,784.00$                 2.00$               6,784.00$                 1.40$               4,748.80$                 
17 P-620E Permanent Non-Reflective Pavement Marking, Black 380            S.F. 2.00$               760.00$                    1.00$               380.00$                    1.40$               532.00$                    
18 P-620F Obliterate Markings 1,570         S.F. 5.00$               7,850.00$                 2.00$               3,140.00$                 2.20$               3,454.00$                 
19 P-620G Pavement Surface Cleaning 40,040      S.F. 0.30$               12,012.00$               0.50$               20,020.00$               0.25$               10,010.00$               
20 P-621 Saw-Cut Grooves 56,020      S.Y. 2.50$               140,050.00$             2.00$               112,040.00$             2.15$               120,443.00$             
21 P-632 Asphalt Pavement Rejuvenation 1,500         S.Y. 7.00$               10,500.00$               16.00$             24,000.00$               6.50$               9,750.00$                 
22 T-901 Seeding 4                Acre 4,000.00$        16,000.00$               22,451.00$      89,804.00$               2,300.00$        9,200.00$                 
23 T-905B Offsite Topsoil 1,770         C.Y. 110.00$           194,700.00$             63.00$             111,510.00$             125.00$           221,250.00$             
24 L-125D Temporary Airfield Lighting - Complete 1 L.S. 210,000.00$    210,000.00$             263,847.00$    263,847.00$             210,000.00$    210,000.00$             

TOTAL BID AMOUNT SCHEDULE B - BASE BID: ALTERNATE 2 (ASPHALT): 8,040,928.00$     7,499,282.00$     7,636,221.00$     -$                       -$                       

NO BID NO BID

SEE PAGE 3 FOR SCHEDULE C

Hi-Way Paving
SCHEDULE B - BASE BID: ALTERNATE 2 (ASPHALT)

Engineer's Estimate Webber Construction Quality Enterprises Banks Construction
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LOWCOUNTRY REGIONAL AIRPORT

BID TABULATION
RUNWAY 5-23 REHABILITATION PROJECT

BID NO.: RBW-2025-02

BID OPENING DATE:  Wednesday, April 30th, 2025 at 2:00 PM

Item # Spec. No. Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
1 01530 Airfield Barricades 1                L.S. 10,000.00$      10,000.00$               10,666.00$      10,666.00$               125,000.00$    125,000.00$             55,000.00$      55,000.00$                 17,000.00$      17,000.00$                 
2 C-100C Contractor Quality Control Plan (CQCP) - Additive Bid 1 1                L.S. 17,000.00$      17,000.00$               106,585.00$    106,585.00$             118,000.00$    118,000.00$             40,000.00$      40,000.00$                 10,800.00$      10,800.00$                 
3 C-102A Temporary Inlet Protection 3                Each 750.00$           2,250.00$                 181.00$           543.00$                    450.00$           1,350.00$                 800.00$           2,400.00$                   300.00$           900.00$                       
4 C-102B Temporary Silt Fence 1,100         L.F. 6.00$               6,600.00$                 4.00$               4,400.00$                 3.60$               3,960.00$                 3.75$               4,125.00$                   4.00$               4,400.00$                   
5 C-105C Mobilization (10% max.) - Additive Bid 1 1                L.S. 85,000.00$      85,000.00$               173,190.00$    173,190.00$             95,000.00$      95,000.00$               115,000.00$    115,000.00$               225,000.00$    225,000.00$               
6 P-101B Pavement Removal by Milling 11,270      S.Y. 15.00$             169,050.00$             7.00$               78,890.00$               6.50$               73,255.00$               15.00$             169,050.00$               9.00$               101,430.00$               
7 P-152 Unclassified Excavation 370            C.Y. 30.00$             11,100.00$               55.00$             20,350.00$               35.00$             12,950.00$               95.00$             35,150.00$                 30.00$             11,100.00$                 
8 P-209 Crushed Aggregate Base Course 500            C.Y. 170.00$           85,000.00$               191.00$           95,500.00$               180.00$           90,000.00$               200.00$           100,000.00$               165.00$           82,500.00$                 
9 P-401 FAA Asphalt Surface Course 680            TON 250.00$           170,000.00$             275.00$           187,000.00$             292.00$           198,560.00$             465.00$           316,200.00$               465.00$           316,200.00$               
10 P-602 Emulsified Asphalt Prime Coat 575            GAL 6.00$               3,450.00$                 12.00$             6,900.00$                 10.00$             5,750.00$                 10.00$             5,750.00$                   * 55.00$             31,625.00$                 
11 P-603 Emulsified Asphalt Tack Coat 128            GAL 6.00$               768.00$                    13.00$             1,664.00$                 5.00$               640.00$                    55.00$             7,040.00$                   * 55.00$             7,040.00$                   
12 P-620C Temporary Pavement Marking, Yellow 260            S.F. 1.50$               390.00$                    6.00$               1,560.00$                 1.40$               364.00$                    1.64$               426.40$                       1.25$               325.00$                       
13 P-620D Permanent Reflective Pavement Marking, Yellow 260            S.F. 2.00$               520.00$                    2.00$               520.00$                    1.40$               364.00$                    1.36$               353.60$                       1.25$               325.00$                       
14 P-620F Obliterate Markings 670            S.F. 5.00$               3,350.00$                 2.00$               1,340.00$                 2.20$               1,474.00$                 2.84$               1,902.80$                   2.00$               1,340.00$                   
15 T-901 Seeding 3                Acre 4,000.00$        12,000.00$               22,451.00$      67,353.00$               2,300.00$        6,900.00$                 2,300.00$        6,900.00$                   * 2,300.00$        6,900.00$                   
16 T-905A Onsite Topsoil 221            C.Y. 50.00$             11,050.00$               53.00$             11,713.00$               55.00$             12,155.00$               115.00$           25,415.00$                 * 35.00$             7,735.00$                   
17 T-905B Offsite Topsoil 750            C.Y. 110.00$           82,500.00$               68.00$             51,000.00$               135.00$           101,250.00$             115.00$           86,250.00$                 45.00$             33,750.00$                 
18 L-108A No. 8 AWG, 5kV, L-824C Cable, Installed in Trench, Duct or Conduit 3,100         L.F. 5.50$               17,050.00$               7.00$               21,700.00$               5.50$               17,050.00$               6.00$               18,600.00$                 2.80$               8,680.00$                   

19
L-108B No. 6 AWG, Bare Solid Copper Counterpoise Wire, Installed in Trench or with 

Duct Bank or Conduit, Including Ground Rods and Ground Connections
2,000         L.F. 5.50$               11,000.00$               7.00$               14,000.00$               5.50$               11,000.00$               6.00$               12,000.00$                 3.00$               6,000.00$                   

20 L-108C Cable Trench in Earth for Direct Buried Cables 1,800         L.F. 6.50$               11,700.00$               8.00$               14,400.00$               6.70$               12,060.00$               7.20$               12,960.00$                 1.00$               1,800.00$                   
21 L-125A Relocate Existing Taxiway Light - Base Mounted 5                Each 3,000.00$        15,000.00$               3,472.00$        17,360.00$               2,775.00$        13,875.00$               2,995.00$        14,975.00$                 1,200.00$        6,000.00$                   
22 L-125B Relocate Existing Taxiway Light - Stake Mounted 24              Each 2,500.00$        60,000.00$               2,500.00$        60,000.00$               2,000.00$        48,000.00$               2,155.00$        51,720.00$                 920.00$           22,080.00$                 
23 L-125C L-858 LED, 3 MOD Guidance Sign on Concrete Foundation, Size 1 6                Each 10,000.00$      60,000.00$               12,498.00$      74,988.00$               10,000.00$      60,000.00$               10,800.00$      64,800.00$                 8,210.00$        49,260.00$                 
24 L-128A Remove and Store Existing Taxiway Lights - Base Mounted 7                Each 500.00$           3,500.00$                 694.00$           4,858.00$                 555.00$           3,885.00$                 600.00$           4,200.00$                   300.00$           2,100.00$                   
25 L-128B Remove and Store Existing Taxiway Lights - Stake Mounted 35              Each 450.00$           15,750.00$               555.00$           19,425.00$               445.00$           15,575.00$               480.00$           16,800.00$                 250.00$           8,750.00$                   
26 L-128C Remove and Store Existing Sign and Demolish Concrete Foundation 1                Each 1,200.00$        1,200.00$                 1,389.00$        1,389.00$                 1,110.00$        1,110.00$                 1,200.00$        1,200.00$                   1,000.00$        1,000.00$                   

TOTAL BID AMOUNT SCHEDULE C:  ADDITIVE BID (TAXIWAY RECONFIGURATION): 865,228.00$        1,047,294.00$     1,029,527.00$     1,168,217.80$       964,040.00$          

GRAND TOTAL BID AMOUNT: 8,546,576.00$     8,665,748.00$     10,315,074.02$     10,395,000.00$     

* Math Error Corrected

Hi-Way Paving
SCHEDULE C - ADDITIVE BID (MID-FIELD TAXIWAY RECONFIGURATION)

Engineer's Estimate Webber Construction Quality Enterprises Banks Construction

The attached bid tabulation is an accurate summary of the bids received on the subject project. Any discrepancy in unit prices or extended totals have been identified.

Certified by Andy Busbee, P.E.
S.C. PE Reg. No. 21252

Page 3 of 3 5/7/2025


